Situation otiStudents at Thoraipakkam flats

Subject: Situation otiStudents at Thoraipakkam flats

From: "S. Vishnu Prasad" <svishnu@imsc.res.in>

Date: 02/12/15, 5:55 PM

To: "V. Arvind" <arvind@imsc.res.in>, Director <director@imsc.res.in>

Respected Sir,

We are in office since morning. We stocked necessary quantities of

diesel, vegetables and provisions. The services at canteen and coffee pantry
are normal. Only a few faculty and only two office staff attended office today.
Students/PDFs strength is normal at coffee pantry & canteens.

Water at Institute premises and guest house complex is maintaining

the same level close to knee deep level every where. We couldnot pump out

water as levels are equal. Even on the main road [our gate to WPT]

water level is same.

Two research scholars who stay on their own with family/mother approached
us and we provided two rooms in guest house as water entered into their
houses outside.

A1l the research scholars including a family of SRF staying at Thoraipakkam

flats are brought to the Institute and provided rooms in guest house as the water
level at Thoraipakkam flats is increasing minute +to minute with present status as
more than waist level. As per reports there is a possibility of increase

in the water level there hence in consultation with the research scholars we

brought them here. Though the shuttle operator denied to operate we forced and
completed this task.

Otherwise situation is under control.

This is for your kind information please.

with kind regards
Vishnu Prasad

1of1 11/01/20, 2:52 PM






Fwd: Re: [Csf] [Faculty] Relief for IMSc stuff aff...

Subject: Fwd: Re: [Csf] [Faculty] Relief for IMSc stuff affected in Chennai flood
From: Siva Subbu Raj <sivaraj@imsc.res.in>

Date: 11/01/20, 3:16 PM

To: "registrar@imsc.res.in" <registrar@imsc.res.in>

-------- Forwarded Message --------
Subject:Re: [Csf] [Faculty] Relief for IMSc stuff affected in Chennai flood
Date:Sat, 19 Dec 2015 19:40:48 +0530
From:bsayan@imsc.res.in
To:all@imsc.res.in

Dear All,

We collected a lot of of clothes and bed sheets, a few utensils and one lakh six
thousand and four hundred rupees. We bought 56 coupons from Saravana
Stores, each worth Rs. 1900/-, and distributed the coupons (along with the
clothes, bed sheets and utensils) among the workers affected in the flood. |
have some spare clothes in my office that | will donate to Aid India.

Swaroop N P, Raja S, G Arun Kumar, Srinivasan G, Jahir Hussain, Gayathri
Divakara and Krishna Balaji did all the work in collecting the money and
materials, interviewing the workers to get an estimate of the number of
affected people, buying the coupons from Saravana stores and distributing
them among the workers. | would also like to thank Rahul Siddharthan,

Amritanshu Prasad, R. Indra, C S Pillai and Sudeshna Koley for their valuable
suggestions.

And thanks to all the donors for your help.

Best regards.
Sayan

Quoting bsavan@imsc.res.in:

Dear All,

This is only a gentle reminder that tomorrow (Tuesday) is the > deadline for
donating money/useful-items for the IMSc workers > affected in the flood.

Best regards.
Sayan

Quoting bsayan@imsc.res.in:
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Fwd: Re: [Csf] [Faculty] Relief for IMSc stuff aff...
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Dear Al1l,

I will be going to IIT-M to attend a set of lectures on Monday and >> Tuesday
mornings (I will be back by 1.30 pm each day). If you want >> to donate money or
some other items for the workers and cannot find >> me in my office, please give
them to either Rahul Siddharthan >> (office number 204, email: rsidd@imsc.res.in)
or Swaroop N P >> (office umber RSA 2, email: npswaroop@imsc.res.in).

Best regards.
Sayan

Quoting bsayan@imsc.res.in:

Dear All,

Please feel free to donate money to this cause if you do not have >>> any
specific item in your possession that you can give away. We >>> will use the
money to purchase the necessary items on Wednesday >>> and distribute them among
the affected workers.

Further, Sudeshna (cced in this email) suggested that we should >>> include
sanitary napkin among the list of necessary items. If you >>> want to donate
sanitary napkins, please contact Sudeshna directly. >>> Her email id is
skolay@imsc.res.in, and you can find her either in >>> her office (RSA 12) or in
her room (FG 16) till Monday 3 pm.

Best regards.
Sayan

Quoting bsavan@imsc.res.in:

Dear All,

Some of us are planning to collect the following materials for >>>> IMSc stuff
and contractual workers who have been affected in the >>>> flood last week.

. Bedsheets and blankets.

. Clothes.

. Kitchen utensils and vessels.

. Mattresses, mats and pillows.

. Mosquito coils and nets.

. Non-perishable food, drinking water and hygiene products.

aulhs WN =

I would like to request all of you to donate any of the above >>>> items by
next TUESDAY (Dec. 15). You can hand them over to me (my >>>> office number is
203) or Swaroop N P (cced in this email, office >>>> number RSA 2). We will

| first distribute the collected items to >>>> all the concerned workers and
stuff. The remaining items (if any) >>>> will be donated to a charity
organization called Aid-India >>>> (http://www.aidindia.in/).

Best regards.
Sayan

| AUU mailing list &
| All@imsc.res.in
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———————— Forwarded Message --------
Subject:Re: [Faculty] [Physf] Tree plantation and pruning trees in IMSc
campus
Date:Sat, 08 Oct 2016 17:32:34 +0530
From:S. Vishnu Prasad <svishnu@imsc.res.in>
To:Parameswaran Sankaran <sankaran@imsc.res.in>

Dear Sir,

Thank you very much for your support which will
am sure encourage us to do more and more
such developmental works in the Institute.

Thanks a lot once again.

with kind regards
Vishnu Prasad

Parameswaran Sankaran wrote:

Dear Shri Vishnu Prasad,

| very much appreciate your green initiative.

Unfortunately, | had given appointment for someone at 15:30 and
so can't participate in the event.

Best regards,

Paramesh
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On Fri, 7 Oct 2016, svishnu@imsc.res.in wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

A quick request once again. Looking for you at tree plantation
ceremony. Kindly make it convenient to spare few minutes and
join us.

with kind regard,
Vishnu Prasad

Quoting "S. Vishnu Prasad" <svishnu@imsc.res.in>:

Dear Sir/Madam,

about:blank
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about:blank

In continuation of my mail dated 3.10.16 [copy appended below]
this is just to remind you about plantation of tree samplings at
1515 hrs today.

You are requested to actively participate in this effort to add
aesthetic value to our campus. You are requested to join

for coffee/tea & snacks at foyer [ground floor] of New Guest
House Building immediately after the event.

Thanks.

with kind regards
Vishnu Prasad

Dear Sir / Madam,

In continuation of our appended mails wherein we promised
plantation of about 30 nos of tree saplings in the campus in lieu of
6 trees cut by us for expansion works of existing library building,
we now propose to arrange plantation of about 38 nos of tree
saplings

on the afternoon of 7/10/2016 (Friday) as per the

following schedule :

Venue : Along with Research Scholar Hostel building in front of
New Guest House Building and football ground.

(i) About 6 tree saplings by members of the Executive Council
at about 1245 hrs on 7/10/2016 (Friday)

(ii) About 32 tree saplings by faculty members of the Institute
at about 1515 hrs on 7/10/2016 (Friday)

In view of the above, interested faculty members of the Institute

are requested to participate in plantation of tree saplings at 1515 hrs
and join for Coffee / tea at foyer of New Guest House building
immediately

after this event.

Thanks,

with kind regards,
Vishnu Prasad

S. Vishnu Prasad wrote:

Dear Madam,

Thank you very much for the information. On realising this fact a
separate mail

attaching therewith the drawing is sent just now. Kindly view the
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Contribution of one day salary to the Prime Mini...

Subject: Contribution of one day salary to the Prime Minister's National Relief
Fund

From: "S. Vishnu Prasad" <svishnu@imsc.res.in>

Date: 23/11/16, 8:29 PM

To: imscfsa@imsc.res.in, pdfs@imsc.res.in, jrfs@imsc.res.in

Dear Sir / Madam,

Kindly refer to the Institute's circular dated 25.2.2016 forwarding
therewith an appeal dated 8.2.2016 of the Chairman, Atomic
Energy Commission and Secretary, Department of Atomic Energy
seeking contributions to the Prime Minister's National Relief Fund
as token of solidarity for the relief and rehabilitation for the people
affected by the floods during November and December 2015 in
Tamil nadu and Puducherry.

Accordingly, the contributions received from the members of the
Institute were made available by us to the Prime Minister's
National Relief Fund.

In this regard a soft copy of communication dated 11.11.2016 as
received from the Prime Minister's O0ffice is forwarded herewith
for information please.

with kind regards,
Vishnu Prasad

— Attachments:

201611232019.pdf 293 kB
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Prive MinisTER'S OFFICE
New Delhi - 110011

P. K. Bali

Under Secretary
Tele: 23013683
FAX: 23015655

Dated: 11-November -2016.

D.O. No. 82[(C-2016/16098)]-PMF

Dear Sir,

We acknowledge with thanks the generous contribution made to the Prime
Minister’s National Relief Fund.

The Prime Minister appreciates this thoughtful gesture and conveys his
gratitude. This valuable contribution will be of immense help in providing
assistance to the persons in distress.

A formal receipt is enclosed.

With regards,

Yours faithfully,

/7 4 : (/Q) a}"‘/
/,/ U L
(e

[P.K. Bali]

SHRI S. VISHNU PRASAD,

REGISTRAR,

THE INSTITUTE OF MATHEMATICAL SCIENCES,
C.ILT. CAMPUS, THARAMANI,

CHENNAI - 600113, TAMIL NADU




PRIME MINISTER’S NATIONAL RELIEF FUND

Receipt No.  7370/2016

(PAN : AACTP4637Q)

Recefved with thanks from THE STAFF MEMBERS OF IMSC

THE INSTITUTE OF MATHEMATICAL SCIENCES,

C.L.T. CAMPUS, THARAMAN],
CHENNAI - 600113, TAMIL NADU

the sum of Rupees

STATE BANK OF INDIA

NEW DELHI
z103631.00

PRIME MINISTER'S OFFICE
NEW DELH!

(Contributions to Prime Minister's
National Relief Fund have been notified
for 100% deduction from Taxable
Income under section 80(G) of Income

Tax Act, 1961)

Cheque Subject to Realisation

Dafed 09/11/2016

ONE LAKH THREE THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED THIRTY ONE RUPEES ONLY v
By Cheque number bearing 652677 dated : 29/09/2016

Section Officer
Prime Minister’s National Relief Fund

{

ecretary
Prime Minister’s National Relief Fund




Tree plantation drive at DAE Nodal Centre, Pall...
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Subject: Tree plantation drive at DAE Nodal Centre, Pallavaram - on 10.4.17

From: "S. Vishnu Prasad" <svishnu@imsc.res.in>
Date: 01/04/17, 12:54 PM
To: all@imsc.res.in

Dear Sir / Madam,

As part of our continuous efforts to contribute new
trees to the campus and society, we propose to organise
tree plantation drive along with the compound walls of
Plot A and Plot B of DAE Nodal Centre (where Research Scholar
Hostel Block and PDF flat let block of IMSc are coming up)
to grow avenue trees on Dr. Ambedkar Road, Cantonment,
Pallavaram, Chennai.

A soft copy of invitation with details is forwarded through
the following link with a request to kindly participate in large numbers
and provide greener and healthier surroundings to the Research
Scholars and PDFs of our Institute who are going to stay at the
above campus in near future.

https://www.imsc.res.in/~office/draft invitation-1.pdf

You are also requested to confirm your participation
through the notebook kept at the Reception Counter, Main Building
by 5.4.2017 (Wednesday) so as to enable us to make necessary
transport arrangements accordingly.

We propose to start from Main Building, IMSc at 0915 hrs on
10.4.2017 (Monday) and to return from the DAE Nodal
Centre, Pallavaram at about 1200 hrs.

with kind regards
Vishnu Prasad

All mailing list
All@imsc.res.in
http://banyan.imsc.res.in/cgi-bin/mailman/listinfo/all
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Appeal by the Secretary, Department of Atomic...
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Subject: Appeal by the Secretary, Department of Atomic Energy, Government
of India

From: "S. Vishnu Prasad" <svishnu@imsc.res.in>
Date: 05/09/18, 3:47 PM

To: all@imsc.res.in

Dear Sir / Madam,

The Chairman, Atomic Energy Commission and Secretary, Department
of Atomic Energy, Government of India vide his appeal dated 4.9.2018
(copy can be viewed through the following link) made an appeal to all the
Members of the Institute to contribute One Day Salary to Prime Minister's
National Relief Fund as a token of solidarity for the relief and rehabilitation
for the people affected by the recent floods in Kerala State.

https://www.imsc.res.in/~svishnu/appeal.pdf

The Members of the Institute who are interested to contribute are
requested to fill an Option Form (soft copy can be viewed through the
following
link) in order to make necessary recovery from the salary / fellowship for
the above purpose payable for the month of September 2018. The duly filled
in form may please be dropped in the box kept near cashier with label
"Contribution to PM's National Relief Fund" on or before 20.9.2018
(Thursday).

https://www.imsc.res.in/~svishnu/optionform.odt

This issues with the approval of the Director, IMSc.

with kind regards,

(QECEEEEEREEEEECEEEEEEEEAEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEREEEEEEEEEEREE
S. Vishnu Prasad

Registrar

The Institute of Mathematical Sciences,

CIT Campus, Taramani,

Chennai 600 113

Mobile : 09444447832

Landline : 044 - 22543150 (direct)

044 - 22541416 (direct)

(@ACEREEECEREEACEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEEAEEALCEREEEEEEEEEEEEE
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Diwali bonus

Subject: Diwali bonus

From: rakeshnetha@imsc.res.in

Date: 15/10/19, 7:26 PM

To: all@imsc.res.in

CC: dishant@imsc.res.in, sanoli@imsc.res.in, manasm@imsc.res.in,
sayantans@imsc.res.in, kamit@imsc.res.in, anupam@imsc.res.in

Dear all,

As you already know, Diwali is around the corner and so is our
little opportunity to thank the amazing service from our mess, house
keeping, gardening staff.

Like every year, this year also we plan to collect money and disburse
it among the contract labourers of IMSc working in:

1. Mess

2. House keeping (hostels and institute)
3. Gardening

4. Civil and Electrical maintenance

5. Shuttle Drivers

Last year there were totally 77 workers and we managed to give 2200 each person.
We hope that everyone of us contributes generously so that we can better our last
year figure.

If you are interested, we request you to give the money to anyone of us:

Vadnala Rakesh Netha rakeshnetha 106, New building
Anupam A H anupam F4, Main building
Amit Kumar kamit RSA-02
Manas Mandal manasm RSA-09

If you like to contribute via online payment, here are the details:

Name: Vadnala Rakesh Netha
Account no: 00000031902934822
IFSC: SBINOOO5916

State bank of India Hyderabad University campus branch

Please mention your name and email id in the comment while

transferring the money and send an email (to rakeshnetha@imsc.res.in)
about the transfer.

Diwali is on 27th Oct (Sunday), so please make sure your contribution
reaches us by 23rd Oct(Wednesday) so that we can distribute it on time.
We hope to get a quick and generous response from all of you.

Thank you,
On behalf of,

Dishant Mayurbhai Pancholi
Sanoli Gun

Sayantan Sharma

Vadnala Rakesh Netha
Anupam A H

Amit Kumar

Manas Mandal
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Diwali bonus

All mailing list
All@imsc.res.in
http://banyan.imsc.res.in/cgi-bin/mailman/listinfo/all
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